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If there were a canon for viewing the night sky, Charles Messier would be its author. The galaxies, star
clusters, and nebulae cataloged by the famous comet hunter in the late 1700s are still the most widely
observed celestial wonders in the heavens. They are the favorite targets of amateur astronomers, with such
rich variety and detail that they never cease to fascinate. This book provides new and experienced observers
with a fresh perspective on the Messier objects. Stephen James O'Meara has prepared a visual feast for the
observer. Using the finest optical telescopes available for amateur work, he describes and sketches the view
from the telescope as never before. There are new drawings, improved finder charts, and new astronomical
data on each object, including findings from the Hubble Space Telescope. Expand your universe and test
your viewing acumen with this truly modern Messier Guide. It is a must for budding night watchers. Stephen
James O'Meara is a contributing editor to Sky and Telescope.
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From reader reviews:

Berneice Ritzman:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Deep-Sky Companions: The Messier
Objects. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Jim Weigel:

Here thing why that Deep-Sky Companions: The Messier Objects are different and dependable to be yours.
First of all studying a book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as
scrumptious as food or not. Deep-Sky Companions: The Messier Objects giving you information deeper
including different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no guide that similar with Deep-
Sky Companions: The Messier Objects. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the
thing that happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. It is easy to bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in
bringing the branded book maybe the form of Deep-Sky Companions: The Messier Objects in e-book can be
your option.

Kurt Rose:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want truly
feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. The Deep-Sky Companions:
The Messier Objects is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Virginia Hughes:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Deep-Sky Companions: The
Messier Objects which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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